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,,~ificant Stuff

MIDI SIG
Terry Abbott Is startJng up the

MUSIC/MIDI SIG again. It 18 sche­
duled for the third Monday of the
month.

If you're Interested In attend­
Ing. give Terry a call at 562-4526
to conflrm the Ume and dale and
get dlrttUons to the location of the
meeting.

TELECOMM SIG
DeWayne Stuart held his lnJ­

lla1 TElECOMMUNICATION SIG In
December.

The meeUngs are being held at
hiS shop. Stuart Electronics. 2299
American Avenue In Hayward.

American Avenue Is off
Clawlter. between Wlnton Avenue
and Jackson. Look for 2306 Amer­
ican Avenue. whICh Is easUy visible
(rom the street. then use the drive­
way across the street.

See the map for help tracking
the place down.

The TelecommunIcation SIG Is
held on the second Tuesday of the
month.

Call DeWayne at his shop.
887·3028. to confirm that the
meeting Is taking place at the
scheduled time and place.

TELECOMM SIG

.......... /, .

", "'~. -\
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Another MIGRAPH hand scanned document.
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What BBS's Do To Me

by John Barnes
John Barnes is the Junkyard Pussyoat
in .Current Notes.
This article was downloaded from GEnie
by Darryl May.

How would you like to be able
to get help from real experts willi a
few strokes on your keyboard?
How would you like a forum for
voicing your complaints? How
about software free for the taking?
Modem electronic Information ser­
vices promIse all of this ~nd more.
This ought to be a real paradise for
computer junkies, right?

For the cost of a modem, a soft­
ware package, an informaUon serv­
Ice subscription, and a few hours
learning to navigate you can Indeed
savor some of these deUghts. Join
the Junkyard Pussycat as he
prowls the online candy stores in
search of a chocolate fix.

This Critique wlll focus 011 the
two services that I am most
familiar with: GENIe, General
Electric Corp's national service.
and ARMUDIC. the local multl-Une
BBS supported by NOVATARL
Compuserve Is another national
service that offers strongAtart sup­
port. while there are hundreds, If
not. thousands, of electronic BBS's
spread across the nation. Your
local dealer should be able to direct
you to one.

Getting Started
The lore of modems. terminal

programs. starting up accounts,
etc. Ls best gotten from one of the
experts in your local user group.
Compuservc's Introductory kit can
be obtained In most stores that
carry computer books. The odds
are that your local dealer runs a
BBS and Irs vIrtually certain that
they can guide you to one of the
local SYSOPs, as the masochists
who run local eleclronic Informa­
tion servtces. call themselves. My
emphasis today is on outcome
rather than technique or tutortal.

One word of caution before you

try to get started. Always pick up
your telephone and listen to the
modem dial the number and walt
for the connect signal when using
autodlal to rJng up a new BBS or
when trying out new hardware or
software. I never will forget the
poor devl1 whose phone number
was one digit different from that of
a local BSS. He did not enjoy
waking up to mystery phone calls
at 1 am.

Signing On
Signing on to one of the Infor­

maUon services Is a lot like playing
a rather tmlmagl.native text adven­
ture game. Instead of Mplck up
sword- you will be asked to work
your way through the dungeons
with M a 1 and a 3 and a 2 ...M. Of
course the Information service is
already Into you for a number of
pennies before you ever get to the
good stuff. There are naVigational
shortcuts and any decent telecom­
munIcations program lets
programmers write Mscrlpt mesMto
deal With the repetitive stuff, like
entering your account name and
password. Non- programmers
should get a friend to help with
thIs because it makes life a lot
sImpler.

All information services offer
generiC products like news bul­
letins, message areas. software
libraries. and chat rooms. Com­
puter junkies can gorge themselves
on this stuff unW the next Master­
Card bill shows that they have
been on Une for 7 hours and owe a
bundle. User-supported servtces
like ARMUDIC don't nick you Uke
thiS, but they also offer a thllUler
gruel than the blggles do because
of their smaller audience and their
Ilmtted capacity for me storage.

Looking for Mr Goodbar
The best service the BBS's offer

Is access to useful software In the
form of utl1lty programs. games. art
work. sound flies. or DTP fonts.
These items are found in the Msoft_

5

ware IibrariesM. Much of it Is
MpublJc domalnM. free for the taking
and using. Other material is
~sharewareM,where the author rat­
tles a tin cup In front of the user.

GEnie's Ubrary includes around
12.000 entrtes at my last count.
As In any large discount candy
store. it Is a problem to find the
Item you want. In my experience It
Is best to look on the local BBS's
first. Their confirmed denizens
delight in astonishing others of
their Uk. with their speed In brtng­
lng home the latest and tastiest
morsels. so you can often save the
cost of a paid download. For more
esoteric material you wl1l have to
shop the aIsles on a naUonal serv­
ice.

All services suffer from poor
cataloguing and Indexing, whIch
makes finding the right title a lot
like picking through the post Hal*
loween candy bargains in your
local drug store. Current Notes has
the complete GEnIe catalog (ea
12.<X>O titles) on discs. This may be
cheaper than downloading It, and
it Is certainly cheaper and mote
reUable to pick through It off line
using a program editor.

Downloading Is time*
consuming. The effective rate of
data transmJsslon for a ]200 baud
modem can be as low as 60
characters per second depending
on the transfer protocol and you
never get the maximum rate be­
cause all protocols have some over­
head associated with them. At this
rate It can take an hour or so to
download a few small flies. Be­
cause of this, and to save space on
their disk drives. the online ser­
vices compress their files into
smaller packages called ARC meso
This also allows the transmission
of several related files 10 one pack­
age. The stuff does have to be un­
compressed and this requires a
special software utility. A good
quality dJsc from one of the Mpubllc
domainMdisc sources wtll usually
avoid all of this and give you a
product that is more or less ready
to use.

There are some software pack­
ages that aHow you to use your
computer for other things while



you are downloading, but multI­
tasking Is not well enough
developed in the Atarl world to
guarantee that this is truly 'useful.
BBS use might be a good reason to
dust off your old 8-hlt machInes If
it weren't for their very limited disc
and memory capacities.

Quality control, while bad
enough In commercial software. Is
non- existent In the pubUc domain
and shareware worlds. The stuff
usually works, but the authors'
Ideas on thls will undoubtedly be
different from yours.

Send a Can<;1ygram
Electronic Mall, or E-Mallin the

BBS jargon, Is a very promising
idea, Send someone a message
and they can read it and reply to
you at thetr convenience. I have
been frustrated with E-Mail about
as often as 1 have been satisfied.
This has to do first of all with the
MreplyR part. Certain correspon­
dents habitually find It Incon­
venient to reply. It Is easIer to
Ignore an E-Mail letter than one
sent via the Postal Service's Snall­
Mall. After all. E-maU gets burled
away in a capture buffer and there
are more exdUng things to do than
to dig It out and respond to It.
Paper letters have a way of floating
to the top of plies on one's desk
and reminding the recipient that a
reply really Is overdue.

The technology that BSS's
apply to thetr matI systems is also
a scandal. The online editing
facilities are a dIsaster because
they are designed for use with anti­
que teletype machines. The most
sensible (and economIcal) thing to
do is to compose the letter offllne
and upload Jt. Use your favorite
word processor with Its spelling
checker, prtnt the thing to disk,
and upload It after Jogging on to
the BSS. Provided. of course, that
the thing doesn't crash while you
are trying, provided that you know
the address of the recipient, and
provided that your upload software
Is smart enough to control the flow
of data to the SBS properly. If the
BSS doesn't crash, your phone
company might mangle your sig­
nal. which can gIve the same effect.

GEnie has a search system for
finding addresses that can be use­
full! you are desperate.

1)rplng away at the keyboard,
whether online or offline, is a poor
way to communicate compared to a
telephone. A letter that takes an
hour or more to type can be dls~

cussed in a conversation of a few
minutes duration with Instant
feedback on misunderstandings. A
telephone call is worth a dozen let­
ters If you have serious buSIness to
discuss.

On balance E-Mail can be U8e­

ful1f both correspondents are con­
scienttous. competent
communicators and If hnrd copy is
essential. The learning curve for
making proper use of these
facilities Is pretty steep.

The Neighborhood
Kaffee Klatch

Most BBS services. like local
supermarkets. allow for the posting
of short notices. The user browses
through the material that has been
posted on a particular topic and Is
gIven the opportunity to add some­
thing to the stream._ If the dIscus­
sion is focussed this can be a
worthwhJJe form of communication
because It lets many people see
what Is happl"ning and share their
experiences. The readcrs get chan­
ces to ask questions and pose solu­
tions to problems.

Problems arise when the
discussion becomes unfocussed.
The Interested reader often has to
wade through too much Irrelevant
or Inflammatory materIal in order
to extract the meat of an Issue.
The technology for entertng text Is
usually even more primitive than
for E-Mail because most message
base systems do not allow for
xmodem uploading of message
texts. There Is also a smaH
population of users who wander off
the subject or who use these mes­
sage threads for their private pur­
poses. This is more of a problem
on local BBS's because the users
feel less restraint there and there Is
less structure to the message
bases to begin with.

I have not tried to do any sys­
tematic statistics on these matters.
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but the repeated occun'cnce of the
same names leads me to believe
thal the electronic vtllage of the
message bases on GEnie's ST
Roundtable Is Inhabited by per­
haps 200 to 300 people. The ac­
tivity reminds me of the gatherings
you can get Into at a neighborhood
Ice cream. parlor.

Of course the message bases
draw the same Idnds of people who
reach out from their lonely Isola­
tion vta ChIldren's Band Radio. I
am slowly learning that what ap­
pears to be wit or sarcasm on the
part of many of these people Is
simply their Ignorance showing
and that a strong dose of tolerance
Is needed to keep from blOWing
one's stack.

One of my favorite bugaboos Is
the Hltle <grin> that some people
wrlle Into messages. I am never
quJte sure whether they are smiling
for joy, for satisfaction after thrust­
ing a knife Into your heart, or out
of sheer lunacy.

Get the Latest Scoop
Many purveyors of goods to the

At.ar1 market am-ertise that product
support Is available on GEnie or
CompuServe. These services
usually make heavy use of the
message base approach with a
much smaller emphaSis on flle
libraries. 1 have been appalled at
the lack of professionalism In these
efforts on the part, first of all, of
the users and secondly on the part
of the companies.

Users who are dissatisfied with
a product or who are Ignorant as to
its functioning (often through no
fault of their own) think nothing of
harpIng on the same subject for
page after page. The people who
couch the replies are so busy
tbinktng up cute comebacks that
they miss the question entirely.
Once again. a phone call is worth a
dozen letters. particularly when the
online respondent has no official
connection with the company.
Tracking these message threads Is
not cheap. It 1s easy to spend an
hour or more wading through a
controversial subject la 2400 baud
modem helps here, but you stili
have to read the stuff).
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Companies should use the file
areas in their product support
roundtables to distribute sound,
sensible. correct information on
the status of theJr exlsttng
products and the avalJabllity of up­
dates and bug fixes. The contents
of the message threads should be
edited into coherent status reports
so that a newcomer can get some
real informatton Instead of
opinions and cute replies. This
would. unfortunately require work.
and most companies don't have
time for that, preoccupied as they
are with Spin control or bug ftxlng.
It Is really amuSing to watch the
message threads illt up with stri­
dent requests for data that
developers don't want to release
before Its time.

Chat Rooms and
Online Conferences

On local BBS's that support
multiple lines it Is possible to chat
back and forth in real time with a
subset of the other users who are
online at the same time. These in­
formal conferences can be a very
useful means of working out
problems but they suffer from one
serious shortcomtng: the incoming
reply can often mangle the Une you
were typing your next question on.
The characters don't get lost, U's
Just hard to pick up the thread.
This might not be too bad with
fewer than 4 people In conference.
but It gets pretty bizarre with 90 or
100, as sometimes happens on
GErtie's on Une conferences.

In such cases the conversation
Is controlled by a moderator and
the members of the audience must
RAIse their hands as If they were
going to the bathroom in elemen­
tary school. The moderator then
lets them know when their tum
will be coming up and they have to
type their question or statement
before the moderator decides to
move on to the next Cl1Btomer.

The quality of the replies from
the responders in such cases
usually leaves a lot to be desired
because the question may be poor­
ly phrased and they didn't really
have time to consider their
answers.

These love feasts are a cross be­
tween an unruly White House

Press conference and an electronic
Woodstock. The best way to learn
the ropes Is to sit back and let the
old hands, who are always present.
ask a bunch of questions. Then
adopt the style that seems to give
the best flow of communication.

When the conference gets too
bortng you can always see which of
your friends are present and ex­
change private telegrams with
them.

The people who ask the ques~

tiona do render a service for all of
us. but you can get a flrst run
movie or four video rentals for the
same amount of money.

If you walch the swoonmgs that
follow the departure of the featured
guest you will understand why t
refer to these as ~Love Feasts".
They are heady stuff for truly ad­
dicted Atarlans. I am trying to
learn to stay away and read the
transcripts after they are posted by
one of the acolytes.

An hour's worth of typing with
time out for thJnk1ng conveys pre­
cious little Information. It would
be nice to .find a better format.

SYSOPS
The people who handle the in­

terface between the user and the
onUne Information servlce.s are
called USYSOPs~ and it would be
hard to find a more dedicated band
of people. SCOTT, ED SEWARD,
DARLAH and JEFF.W have been
very nice to me and the services
they have rendered to the com­
munJty have been Olympian. They
are a specIal breed because of the
way they mix professIonalism with
cartng.

All of the complaints I have set
forth In the preceding have been
largely with regard to matters
beyond their control. The
machinery and software that they
have to live with has been con­
structed by someone else.

I hope that my SYSOP acquain­
tances can appreciate the
distinction between criticism of
their systems and criticism of
themselves.

The Future
In summary: while online infor­

mation services offer great poten­
tial, they have yet to fully realize It.
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ThIs Is equally true of services like
Internet, Bitnet, Usenel. and
others that professIonals use.

Compu ter technology on
mainframes and micros alike is
capable of dOing much beUer. The
user interface to the Mail system
on a VAX, for example, is vastly
better because It makes effective
use of modern terminals. Newer
operating systems support multiple
sessions on sIngle terminals. This
approach falls apart when one
must allow for obsolete terminals
and It falls apart even worse when
different computers must be
hooked together, as on Internet.

Microcomputer operating 8YS~

tems do not yet perform effective
mulUtasklng, which is essenUal to
writing terminal programs that
allow the user Lo type in one win­
dow while the capture screen
scrolls by in another. Perhaps
there is somethIng oul there. but
my queries have not yielded any­
thing.

The customer also bears
responsibUity for the quallty of the
products received because they do
not press for anything better and
they fail to make effecllve use of
the resources that are available
even If these are archaic.

Count Your Calories
There are horror stories floating

around about $300 monthly bills
for onlIne services. I suspect that
there are more than a few
frustrated spouses wondering what
their mates see in the ~boob tube~.

I know of a number of households
where teenagers are forbidden to
purchase modems.

These cases are somewhat ex­
treme. but It does take a certain
amount of diSCipline to keep from
getting sucked In. One key Is not to
expect too much. Another Is to be
selective. AImless browsing eats
up connect time. Download the
things you really need, read mes­
sages on topics that are genUinely
important to you.

Like hot fudge sundaes, the
stuff frpm electronic BBS's is fine
when taken In moderaUon.



UPDAT[ fROrl DARRYL

Compiled by DarTyl May
Also published monthly in Tht Lily
Pad, the newsletter of the Front Range
Atan Users' Group.ItIIl :!:':bo".!;~ 1 eu to

• , This month's column
comes from the home
office In Piedmont.
California. I'm out of

school for about a month. for
Christmas vacation, and looking
forward to seeing everybody at this
month's meeting. Back In Colorado
I have taken Dve... as editor of the
local club's newsletter. So far I
have put together two Issues wtth
the help of another editor. but the
other guy has lost Interest so I'll
be putltng the next newsldter
together by myself. If I have It done
by the next SLCC meeUng I'll brtng
a sample to pass around.

sig Hartmann retires from
Atarl but then takes a Job with
Televldeo. See page 8 of the Dec.
19th to Jan. 15th Issue of Com­
puler Currents for more details.

Atarl's Lynx (portable color
game system) Is available In
Ilmlted supply In Ilmlted areas In
the U.S.: locally at the roYHOUSE
stores In Alameda. Montclair and
Oakland. The Lynx has an eight·
way conlroller and two sets of fire
bullons. Three option bullons ac·
commodate up to five different
functions. The system also In·
c1udes volume. brIghtness and
contrast controls. as well as Jacks
for headphones and a Lynx port.
Users may nip the screen 180
degrees for right or left handed
play. With linkable game cart·
ridges and the ComLynx1lll cable.
up to eight systems can be con·
necled for multt·player or team

challenges. The one pound system
o~rates on six ~AA· batteries and
Includes California Games1lll . a
ComLynxDl cable for mulU-user
play and an AC adapter. Several
addition games pr1ced at $34.99 to
$39.99 are avaUable with more in
development. The Lynx carries a
prtee tag of$I79.99.

Alart stock rose to 105/8 on
November 28. It eventually sUd to
a close of 8 7/8 on December 22.
probably on news of Atar!'s third
quarter loss of $5.4 mUllan.

Apple o~ned Its seventeenth
InternaUonal subsidIary office In
Singapore.

WHAT THE WORLD NEEDS
IS MORE LAWYERS

Nlntendo CUed addlUonal copy­
right and patent Infringement
claims against Alarl Games. Nln·
tendo's complaint alleges that
Atar! Games unlawfully obtained a
Nlntendo computer program from
the U.S. Copyright Office and used
It In the manufacture of Nintendo
compaltble cartridges. The Mcom·
puter program· or Mlock·out sys­
tem· Is really a chip tnslde each
cartridge to prevent copying of the
cartridge or the manufacture of a
cartridge. Nlntendo doesn·t allow
anyone to make cartridges for It's
system.

Atarl Games qUickly
responded. saying the Nlntendo
complaint Is Just a legal tactic
designed to further obscure the
real Issue of whether Nlntendo Is
In violalton of U.S. antitrust laws
and that Nlnlendo Is apparently
embarrassed that It made Its com·
puter code public and Is scram·
bUng to cover up Its own
Ineptness.
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Representative: Denn1s E. Eck·
art (D-Ohlo) of the House Small
Business antitrust subcommittee
has sent a letter detailing Nlnten·
do's possible antitrust vIOlations to
the Honorable James F. Rlll. Assls·
tant Attorney General. Antllrust
Division. U.S. Department of Jus·
tlce. In the letter both Atan Cor­
poration and Atarl Games are
mentioned.

Alarl Corp. President Sam
Tramlel CaDle out In a press can·
ference saying -Nlntendo has
demonstrated Its disregard for fair
and open com~tltlon In America.
It has re~atedly used restrtctlve
practices to promote Its business
without regard to the publlc's
freedom of choice. ~ Tramlel also
noted that. MWe have several new
and exCIting tllIes lined up for the
Lynx1lll system and hope to make
as many arrangements with soft­
ware developers as we can. My
only hope Is that Ntntendo can ac­
cept fair and open compelltlon.~

In January 1989 Alarl Cor·
paratlon brought Its own antitrust
lawsuit against Nlntendo In
Federal Court.

Dennis Wood, senior vice pres I·
dent of Atarl Games. released the
fonowtng statement: ~Nlntendo has
promoted the myth that It. and It
alone. Is the champion of the home
video game Industry. The reality Is
that Nlntendo'S behavior In the
United States Is so atrocious that
It requires the action of the
Department of Justice to restore
free competition to the market. It
Is no secret that Atart Games Cor·
poratlon and Its wholly owned
subsldiaJy, Tengen Inc.. have been
Involved In a blUer lawsuit with
Nlntendo over the very Issues
raised today by Representative
Eckart In his request for a Justice
Department investigation Into NIn·
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lendo's Business pracUct:s. We ap·
plaud Rep. Eckart's recognlUon
that Nlnlendo's monopoUsUC bust·
ness practices transcend the legal
diSputes belwttn the two parties.
and fully support his recommen­
dation (or a full-scale investigation
into Nmlendo's unlawful domina­
lion of the U.S. home video game
market. Atart Games and Tengen
will cooperate fully with any con­
Unulng investigations.

Slnce Tengen first introduced
Its line of independently manufac­
tured Nlntendo compatible
cartrtdges In December 1988, Nln­
tendo has attempted to (orce Ten­
gen out of the borne video game
market through a deUberate cam­
paign of dIstortion. Intimidation
and coercion. This campaign has
included a barrage of lntlmldaUng
letters from Nlntendo's outside
legal coWlsel and senJor vice presi­
dent; Nlntendo bas threatened
relallers wtlh lawsuIts and product
aUocaUon cuts if they continue to
carry Teogen products. As a
result. Nlntendo's polley of In­
timIdation has caused slgnlflcant
damage to Tengen's overall busl·
ness:

Ptpsi·Cola has stopped using a
print advertisement In People
MagaZine featuring Nlntendo's
Game Boy. Alart noted that the ad
incorrectly shows the Nlntendo
Game Boy with a color screen
while In fact Atar1's LynxTM Is the
only hand-held game system with
a full-color screeD.

Apple and Quick-view S,..·
terns lnc./HyperRacks Inc. have
reached a settlement resolvtng a
cUspute over patent rights relating
to Apple's HyperCard. QuIckview
got an pocket full of cash and
some cross licenses. QulCkvtew 18
operated by Paul Heckel who
produced WOMRACKS for the sr.
For people who have had
-troubles- with ZOOMRACKS
Paul's phone number is (415)
965·0327.

A1arI gave about 400 Federated
employees the boot In early
December when all of the
Federated stores In Houston and
Dallas wert: dosed.

Currently all of the inventory Is
being UquJdated and should be
gone In five to six month9.

PRESS RELEASES ON GEnlelll

Branch Alwa,.. Software Is
proud to announce Its enlry Inlo
lhe Atarl ST retail soHware
market. The company was founded
by two programmers you already
know weU, Ignac A. Kolenko and
Darek Mlhocka. authors of several
popular public domain and
shareware programs.

Up unW now. our software was
available only as shareware, But
we understand that nol aU users
have access to bulletin boards and
that some users want the con­
venience of being able to buy soft­
ware through a dealer. Our first
product. QuIck ST. Is now ship­
ping to Atarl dealers throughout
the US and Canada. It includes 3
programs for a price of only
$19.95. The package contains
Qutck Sf version 1.7. guk:k Index.
and QUk:.k View. as well as some of
our previously released public
domain software.

Branch Always Software can be
reached at P.O. Box 2634. Station
B; Kltchener, Ontario N2H 6N2:
Canada: (519) 570-4340. Also on
GEnie as DAREKM, on Com­
puserve 0 73657,2714. and 00

Usenet as
uuneUwatcglleleclrolbrasofUlgnac
or
uuneUwatcgllelectrolbrasoflldarek.

MegaType Software has an­
nounced that It Is releaSing
FONlVERTER. a program that al­
lows the conversion of outline
fonts between PageStream and
Calamus.

FONTVERTER carries a price
of $39.95. MegaType Software can
be reached at P.O. Box: 645: South
Bend, IN 46624.
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Duggan DeZlgn Introduces
snK-GRiPPER. an adjustable saUd
steel Joystick clamp. It allows one
handed Joystick operation by
clamping the JoysOck to the table
top. SllK-GRlPPER has a Ust pl1ce
oC$18.95.

Duggan DeZlgn Inc. can be
reached at 16 Oak Ridge Drive:
West WarWick, RI 02893 or
K.DUGGAN on GEnie.

The U.S, couldn't Ond NOriega
but If you have an Apple II com­
puter you can "Find Noriega" in a
new computer program.

-Follow all the exciting
episodes from the first non­
capture to the last non-eapture, as
Nortega breathlessly sUps through
the fingers of the CIA and U.S.
armed forces time and time
again,.: said a news release for
the game.

Fonowlng clues and Informa­
Oon, players can search Heritage
Park and Interrogate Tammy Bak­
ker, the wlfe of PTL founder, Jim
Bakker.

You caD Intercept top secret
coded messages from the CIA to
President Bush and fight off
screaming fans at Graceland to
discover Noriega or his look alike
disguised as Elvis?

The game was completed In 20
hours by uSing an adventure writ­
ing system.



Elvis Bops the 8-Bit Beginner Boogie
UH·OH get tlJe net, guys 'Nother one sittin' too close to his monitor.

by

Dave Morel

Hi. Buoky. JUSllhc OIhcr day my ok! buddy EJvis
and I were sitting around the lcitchcn when he said,
-Hush mab mour, Dave, 1 shore do wisht I had me
some kinda ideal of how to use them TNT and RND
functions on mah Alari; and 110ld him I was "Orry to
bear he'd been troubled by this and I was gonna hep
him, and I did (What?, you didn't know Elvis was still
alive? Well. he is, and when be's DOl Slaying with me
he lives in South America with a beauti(ullovc-slavc
alien princess rrom lbe planel Anthrax in the Ann
Dromedary galaxy whom he rescued when her
UFO--which had been sabotaged by minions of her
evil step-brother, Thingec, who secretly covets the
throne which is rightly hers·-cxplodcd and crashed
inlo the midst of a tribe or blood-thirsty pygmie
cannibals who dragged her nude and nubile body
(rom the wreckage and had her tied to a stake with
hOI. and hungry names licking at her feet when
suddenly--oh, but never mind. There's no point in
horing you with the drab and dreary details of the
sort of incident Inat is. in this day and age, an
all-too--common happenslance).

The first thing I told the King (as we sometimes
call him) is thaI the INT function strips off all the
numbers (0 the right of lhe decimal poinl, leaving a
whole number, or INTeger. It's important 10 realize
that this is nOl a rounding orr proccss--for example
INT(2.1) equals 2, but INT(2.99999) also equals 2.

So why should you care? Well, you can do some
ncat things with INT. For instance, suppose you
want to do something in a program when a certain
variable is even and du something else when that
variable is odd. All }oU gotta do whenever that
variable shows up is take the INTeger of the variable
divided by two and compare that number with half of
lhe INTeger of the variable. If both numbers are the
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same, tbe variable is even_ If they aren't, of course,
the variable is odd. Like this:

100 T1 - INT( /2),1'2 - INT( )/2
110 IF T1 .. T2 TH EN ? 'This sucker is even."
120 IF TI < > 12 THEN? '"This one is odd."

While it's true, as 1 told you above, that INT
doesn't round numbers off, you can still usc it to get
a rounded number. ~1erely add .s to the number you
want rouoded and then usc the INTeger oC it:
X-INT(N+.5)

But suppose you don't want to round to a whole
number, but only to a specirted number of decimal
rlaces. Here's how to do it for two places:
X :o.INT(N·IOO+ .5)/100. Let's see how this works in
rcalliIe. Say N .. 23.4567. We multiply this by 100
aDd get 2345.67. Adding.5 gives us 2346.17. The
INTeger of that is 2346, and dividing by 100 gives us
23.46.

There's more fun to be had with INT, but first we
need to take a quick look at our furry, feathered
friend, lhe RND function. RND(O) returns a random
number between 0 and .999999999, inclus.ive. The
arithmetical cxprc!»ion between the parenthesis is.
called an argument (I don't know why), and you must
includt: one, although it doesn't mattcr what it is.

A random decimal number in itself isn't all thaI
useful, but, with a liule help from INT and some
simple arithmetic, we can turn it inlo something that
is. For example, N-INT(RND(O)·IO) wiU return a
whole number from 0 through 9. By adding I we get
a whole number from I through 10:
Ns:INT(RND(O)flO+I). And from tJUsit follows
that if we want a range of numbers from I to
whatever, all we gotta do is say
N "" INT(RND(O)·whalcver+ I).



But what happens if you want your minimum
number to be greater than I? Probably the easiest
way to explain it is to show it. Say you're looking [or
a random number between 5 and 15. The way to get
it is N; INT(RND(O)* 11 +5). That's all there is to it.
Multiplying by 11 gives us a number from 0 to 10
(plus some decimal places), adding 5 to that gives a
number from 5 to 15 (plus some decimal places), and
then we use the INTeger.

Well, I'd like to stay and talk some more, but I
gOlla go. The Big E is tuning up in the other room
and he wants me to belp him harmonize.

You ain'llIulhill bill a grollndhawg,
jes a barfing aUa time....

Pounding on the

8-Bits

by

Bob Woolley SLCC

I hope everyone had a wonderful Christmas this
year and is ready for the onset of the 'Ws! Things arc
looking up for most of the world where they've had
liule to cheer about for many years. The Global
Community hasn't had a better Christmas present in
many, many years!

Speaking of presents, one of mine was a novel by
Dean R. Koontz about a mad scientist who "infects" a
whole lawn with cell-sized computer chips that
subsequenlly run amok. Jeeezzz...... Talk about a
computer phobia! As if the chips had a mind of their
own. How many times have you tried to write a
simple database program and made a few
programming errors? (come on,lhe truth!) Did your
program perform like Lotus 1-2-3 and DBase IV
rolled into one, instead o[ the plodding back you
were trying to write? How often docs Intel or
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Motorola design a 200 voh power transistor and have
it not only work at 12KV, but have lefO
on-resistance? Sure, happens alia time.

Many of you may not havc noticed, hut a couple of
things are not happening quilC the same as they used
to within the Club.

Our Journal has been pUI together by Jim Hood
for the lasl few months since Frank's life is still
shaking from the quake ( remember the catbquake?
Frank sure docs... ). Lucky for us lhal we have a guy
like Jim to carry the load. Why don't you let him
know how much we appreciale it ncxt time you sec
him?

We no longer have a DOM from the 8-bit side of
the house. I guess it's going to stay that way until
someone steps in to pick up that load - Jim's rather
busy .

I have almosl finished the PC board for the dual
ANTIC upgrade and am looking ror a few voluntccrs
who could whip up demos or utilities for the thing. I
will supply a 1200XL with the mod in exchange for a
couple of well done programs. If you arc interested,
call or write:

Bob Woolley
1161 Bay St.
Alameda, CA 94501
(415)+865-1672

I am running really, rcally late this month (so,
what's new about that?), so I don't have time to spell
out the features of the thing this month. Maybe next
month......

I hear there is also a piece on a dual POKEY
modirication coming our way. We may have dual
everything to play with pretty soon!

Later!



Since Nate got me a scanner, I
figure the least I can do is scan
in his picture. I hope including
Cindy keeps me out of trouble for
spencfing so much time on this.

With Jim Hood
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In last month's Scanning
Around article I forgot to
hank Berkeley Mlcrosystems

for the use of a Mlgraph hand
scanner.

They were kind enough (or
shrewd enough) to let me keep the
scanner after they demo'ed It at
our November Sf SIG meetrng.

By the time I had to return It I
wanted to keep It.

My son. Nathan, got me one of
my very own for Chrtstmas.

Thanks. Natel
He called Mlgraph to find out

what he needed to buy 10 get me
back In business. He said they
were very helpful. lelllng him thai I
wouldn't need software, since I
had that and giving him dealer
names to contact.

He ended up buying It at
MlcroWorld. where he satd BUI was
also very helpful.

Not knowing, I went In to
MlcroWorld to ask BHl If It was
possible to buy the scanner from
them without the software.

He suggested thai I walt unlll
the 28th, saying that he thought I
could get a better deal then. Good
Idea.



[l~~~
WrST COAST COI'1PUTrR fAIRrS

~
eems to me that Atart would
gel the attention of more
unbelievers if they spent

their computer fair money
exhibiting at the WCCF rather
than havlng an exclusive Northern
California Aiari Expo.

1&11 of these pictures were
scanned at 400 dpl. USing
the finest dither pattern of

the Migraph hand scanner. Miee
importing them into PageSlream,
they were enlarged to 132% for
printing on a 300 dpllaser printer.
This seemed to give less cross
hatching tban 133% enlargement.

...\~,"
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~
tarl has yet another
President of Alarl U.S.

ongratulaUons to Gary
Tramlel on his appointment to
this poslUon.

I hope that Atarl has seen
fit to at least pick the brains of
the dozen or so previous
holders of this Job.

If Gary doesn't work out, I
say It's high tIme to hire 81U
Yerger.



AN'S ~INLJTI:S

.."._.. _.. _.. _.. _.. - .. _.. - ..- .. - .._.. - _._ .. _.. _.. _.. -",

General Meeting
December 5, 1989

The meeting was called to
order at 8:00 PM by President
Sammons. All 0fIlccrs present.

ANNOUNCEMENTS,

A new Bonware dealer, Ex­
caliber Software was Introduced.
It Is a mall order sltuaUon only at
this time pending the acquisition
of a store.

Representattves will be at the
ST SIG on t.he lith to show the
program WORDFUJR. This is the
excellent new document processor
that was parUally shown last
month.

3E has sent several copies of
their current sales brochures.

Contact has been reestabUshed
with one of the companies that
puts on swap meets. They wUl be
sending us a list of upcoming
shows.

of his fellow workers at ATARl. It
seems that Bob is suffertng from
longevity. Thb strange disease: Is
one that few ATARI employee's
ever have a problem wlth, especial·
1y User Group Representattves.

Seeing as Charles was in the
area he volunteered to be the
guest speaker for the evening.
Charles who formally worked for
ANIIC magazine, starting to work
at ATARI about a month ago to
work with ATARl developers.

Cherry updated the members
with all the wheeling and dealing
goJng on at ATARI. Along with a
small assist from BrocUe we were
told of some of the thoughts and
plans that ATARI has which hope­
fully these two all around good
guys will be able to help put into
reallty.

During the extended break we
all enjoyed Ice cream and cake

which was looked over by ugly
Bob's pretty wJfe Sharon. Thts
party was, of course. to celebrate
Christmas and our upcomlng 7th
birthday.

To close out an enjoyable eve­
ning. the night's raffle was held.
Top Item was a copy of PAGE­
STREAM 1.8 that was donated to
the club by Sort-LogIk PublIshing
Corporation. Soft-Loglk probably
would not have donated It to the
club if they knew that the head
raffle thief, Peter Corona, would
again bribe Jim Hood to let him
win the raffle. Oh well. I guess
Pete should win sometimes for all
the support he gives the club.

BeJng no furthu business th.ls
year the meeting was adjourned at
lOPM.

RespecUully submitted - Jim
Moran - Secretary

We have an offer from Amrf In­
terface Magazln.e. This magazine
can be ordered at 50 cents a copy.
a very attracUvc offer, but only If
enough members desire. Anyone
Interested should contact tbe
President.

The rumor thai ANALOG
magaZine Is In trouble Is not a
rumor. They are history as of the
December 1989 Issue.

One of the club's newest mem­
bers, Bob Brodie, was able to come
to tonight's meeting only with the
assistance of Chades Cherry one

For Sale:

ICn..SDmgg.Haal..Dri~!:

Less than 1 year old, 28 msec access time,
Buill-in clock, Stylish and Durable Case,
2 DMA ports, Expansion port.

Asking $700

Contact Darryt May @652-9082

" .• _.• _.__ .• _. __ .__ .• _.• _.• _.• _.• _.• _.M _.• _.• _. __ .• _.•'
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Membership Application for the San Leandro Computer Club
Yes, I would like to receive 12 months of the SLCC JOURNAL along with other membership

benefits. including software discounts, training. technical assistance and much, much more for one
low,low price. I have filled out the application below and am including my check. for $20.00 (or
$40.00 if I am outside the US or Canada). I can hardly wait!

Name: ~Date: _

Address: -==,-- ,--=.,--- =.".,-__--,;;=_
(S<=.) (City) (Slale) (ZIP)

Home Phone: =-".---,,- I
-::-_----,-,-- (Op_"_·ooal_) Members~jp No.
Computer(s) 7H..::ar=d"D"'ir"s~"'("'s)':.':::.~':::._::::.':::._::::._::::._::::._::::._::::._::::._::::.':::.':::.':::.':::."=-

Monitor(s) Modem(s), _

Disk Drive(s) Printer(s) _

Other: _

Programming Experience: 0 Professional 0 Average 0 Learning 0 Hate It !
I!Programming Languages: I

!Inlerests:O Business 0 WordProcessing 0 Hardware 0 Education 0 Music i
! 0 Home Finance 0 Art/Desktop Pub. 0 Scientific 0 Garnes 0 Other !L ~
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We Will Raffle the
New WORDFLAIR,

Integrated Word Processor
at the

General Meeting

San Leandro Computer Club
P,O, Box 1506

San Leandro. CA 94577-0374 o

A First Class Newsletter, Sent by FIRST CLASS MAIL to FIRST CLASS PEOPLE.


